The Vehiclesand Road Traffic 1 ANTIGUA

No. 15 of 1995.
(Amendment) Act, 1995. AND
BARBUDA
[LS]
| Asent,

JamesB. Carlisle,
Governor-General.

27th December, 1995.

ANTIGUA AND BARBUDA
No. 150of 1995.
An Act to amend the V ehiclesand Road Traffic Act (Cap. 460).
[ 11th January, 1996 |
ENACTED by the Parliament & Antigua and Barbuda as
follows—
Short title.

1. This Act may be cited as the Vehiclesand Road Traffic
(Amendment) Act, 1995.

2 Section150f theV ehiclesand Road Traffic Act (Cap460),
inthisActreferredtoastheprincipal Actisamendedasfollows—

Amendment of
Section 15.

(a) insubsection(1), by deleting the words "one thou-
sand" and subgtituting therefor the words"fivethou-

sand;

by repeding subsection (5) and subgtituting the

(b)
following—

"(5) Upon any conviction for an offence
under paragraph (a) of subsection (1) the
Magidtrate in addition to any other pendty
which may be imposed unless such licence



ANTIGUA
AND
BARBUDA

Amendment of

Section 23.

The Vehicles and Road Traffic No. 15 of 1995.
(Amendment) Act, 1995.

duty hasbeen paid subsequentto thecommis-
son of theoffence,shall order theowner of the
vehicleor trailer to pay into court to the credit
of theAccountantGeneral ,twot i e sthevaue
of the amount of the relevant licence duty
whichwoul d havebeen payableif suchlicence
has been taken out at the proper time.

(6) Any owner whofailsto pay theamount
orderedunder subsection (5)isliabletoaterm
of imprisonmentfor three months.”

3, Section 23 of theprincipal Actisrepealed and replaced by
the following—

"(1) Subjecttosubsection (3) every licence
under section 15 shall remainvalidforaperiod
of twelvemonthsor such shorter periodas the
Commissioner of Inland Revenuemay deter-
mine.

(2) Theowner of any vehicleortrailershall,
at least fourteen days before the expiration of
the licence, apply to the Commissioner of
Inland Revenuefor therenewal of thelicence.

(3) The Commissioner of Inland Revenue
shall not renew a motor vehicle or traler
licence unless—

(a) heissatisfied that the vehicle or
trailer does not differ in any re-
spect from particularsin the Reg-
ister of Motor Vehicles:

(b) the motor vehicle or trailer has
been examined by the Examining
Officerfor road worthinessand a
certificate of fitness in respect
thereof is produced;

(c) thereisinforcein respect of such
vehicleor trailerapolicy of insur-



No. 15 of 1995. The Vehicles and Road Traffic 3 ANTIGUA

(Amendment) Act, 1995. AND
BARBUDA
ance or such security ascomplies
with therequirement of the Motor
Vehicle Insurance (Third Party
Risks) Act (Cap 288);

(d) heissatisfied that the provisons
of this Act and any regulations
meade thereunder have been com-
plied with.

4. Section300f theprincipa Actisamendedinsubsection(1)  Amendment of
as follows— Section 30.

(a) by deleting the words"one year" appearing in the
proviso and substituting the words"two years'; and

(b) by deleting the words "one thousand" appearing in
the proviso and subgtituting the words "five thou-
sand”.

5. Section 31 of the principal Act isamended asfollows— A mendment of
Section 31.
(a) by deetingthewords"classor classes' appearingin

paragraphs (b) and (c) and subgtituting the words

"typeor types’; and

(b) by renumberingsection 31 as subsection (1);
(c) by inserting the following new subsections

"(2) For the purpose o this section, the
following are the classes of drivers licences

and the types of motor vehiclesreferredtoin
subsection(1)—

Classdf Licence  Typesdf Motor Vehide

Motor cycle Motor cycle

driver'slicence.

Privatedriver's Private motor car,

licence Rentd vehicles,
Pickups, trucks
and vans not
exceeding 11,201

lbs.



ANTIGUA 4 The Vehicles and Road Traffic No. 15 of 1995.

AND (Amendment) Act, 1995.
BARBUDA
Chauffeur's Omnibus,
licence. Tractor,
Earth moving
vehicle,
Taxi.

(3) The TrafficCommissioner may by Or-
der add to thelist of typesof motor vehicles
specified in subsection (2)."

Amendment of 6. Section 32 df theprincipal Act isrepealed and replaced by
Section 32, the following—

"32. Driver'slicencesshal bein suchform
asmay be prescribed and shall—

(a) haveadffixedor imprinted thereto
the photograph and signature or
the facsmile of the photograph
and the signature of the holder
thereof;

(p) indicate the class of licence and
thetypedf motor vehiclethehol der
islicensed to drive

(¢) indicateany restrictionsimposed
on a holder who is partialy dis-
abledor suffersfromsomeformof
physica defect.

Amendment of 7. Section 38 of theprincipal Actisrepesled and replaced by
Section 38. the following—

"38. A driver's licenceis, unless previoudy
suspended, cancelledor revoked, vaidfor one
year from the date of birth of the holder and
mayberenewedfor afurtherperiod of oneyear
or a period o three years a the request of
holder."

Amendment of 8. Section 39 o the principal Act isrepedled and rephced by
Section 39. the following—



No. 15 of 1995. The Vehicles and Road Traffic 5 ANTIGUA
(Amendment) Act, 1995. AND
BARBUDA

"39. (1) The holder of a driver's licence
issued under this Act may, a least fourteen
daysbeforetheexpirationaf thelicence, apply
to the licensing officer for the renewal of the
licence.

(2) The Commissioner o Inland Revenue
shdl, subjectto section 36 and on payment of
the prescribed fees, renew the licence.

(3) Every licence that expires and is not
renewed within three monthsof thedate of its
expiration shall be cancelled.

9. Section41 of the principal Actisrepededandreplacedby  Amendment of
the following— Section 41.

"(1) Any person whodrivesamotor vehicle
on any road shdl haveeither on his person or
in such motor vehicle hisdriver'slicence.

(2) Any person who fails to comply with
subsection (1) is guilty of an offenceand is
liableon summary convictiontoafinedf five
hundred dollars.

(3) Thedriver of amotor vehicleshall, on
being so required by any police officer, pro-
ducehisdriver'slicencefor examinationso as
to enable the palice officer to ascertain the
name and the address of the holder of the
licenceand the date of issue of thelicence.

(4) Ay person who fails to comply with
subsection (3) isguilty of an offence and is
liable on summary convicticn to afined two
thousand dallars.

(5) No person shdl be charged under sub-
section (2) or (3) if the person produces the
licencein person within forty-eight hoursat a
policestationtowhich heisdirecteda thetime
production was required.”



ANTIGUA
AND
BARBUDA

Amendment d
Section 66.

The Vehicles and Road Traffic No. 15 of 1995,
(Amendment) Act, 1995.

10. Section 66 of the principal Act isamended as follows—
by renumbering section 66 as subsection (1);and

by inserting after subsection (1) the following—

(2) Any police officer or constable shal
removeand impound any vehiclefound on the
road in respect of which thereisnot in forcea
policy of insurance or such security as com-
plieswith the requirementsof the Motor Ve-
hiclesInsurance(Third Party Risks) Act (Cap
288).

(3) Any vehicdleimpounded under thissec-
tion shall bekept in the custody of the Traffic
Commissioner until such time astheowner of
the vehicle—

(a) producestothesatisfactiond the
TrafficCommissioner,apolicy of
insuranceor such security ascom-
plies with the requirement of the
Mator VehiclesInsurance (Third
Party Risks) Act (Cap 288); and

(b) paysto the Traffic Commissioner
the cost of the remova and the
prescribed charges for impound-
ing the vehicle.

(4) The Traffic Comtnissioner may, three
monthsafter—

(a) impoundingany vehicleunder this
Act; or

(b) the finad determination of any
crimina matter in relation to any
moator vehicle so impounded,

disposeof the vehicle by public auctionor in
any other manner asthe Traffic Commissioner
thinksfit if the vehicleis not removed by the



No. 15 of 1995.

The Vehiclesand Road Traffic 7
(Amendment) Act, 1995.

owner from the custody of the Traffic Com-
missioner within the period prescribedin this
subsection.

(5) Before disposing of any vehicle under
this section the Traffic Commissioner shdl
publish two timesin the Official Gazette and
one of the newspaperscirculatingin Antigua
and Barbudaa notice specifying theowner and
number of the vehicleand indicating the date
on which the auction will take place.

(6) Theproceedsof thesaeof any vehicle
under this Act, shall first be utilizedto pay —

(a) the cost of the publication and
sale

(b) thecostof removal and storagein
the pound; and

(c) the remainder to be pad to the
owner of thevehicle.

(7) Neither the Traffic Commissioner, a
police officer, nor any person authorized by
him in writing to remove and impound or
immobilize any vehiclewhichhasbeenusadto
contravene the provisionsof this Act or any
other Act or Regul ationsmade under any other
enactment shall beliablefor any damageto, or
loss of any part of or articlein the vehicleso
immwobilized or removed and impounded.

11. Section 78 of the principal Act is amended in subsection
2by deletingthewords"fivehundred doilars™ and substituting the
words "five thousand dollars or to a term of imprisonment for

twelve months'.

12. Section 85 of me principal Act is amended as follows—

(a) m subsection (1) (b), by deleting the words"at any
timeafter thelicenceexpires' appearing thereinand
substituting the following—

ANTIGUA
AND
BARBUDA

Amendment of
Section 78.

Amendment d
Section 85.



ANTIGUA 8 The Vehicles and Road Traffic No. 15 of 1995.
AND (Amendment) Act, 1995.
BARBUDA

"twenty-eight days after the removal by the Traffic
Commissioner;"

(hi  msubsection(3), by deletingthewords"threemonths'
and substituting the words "twenty-eight days" and
by deleting thewords"fromthedateof removal” and
inserting the words"from the date of payment of the
charges n respect of the removal and storage'.

Amendment of 13. Section 87 of the principal Act isamended in subsection

Section 87. (3) by deleting thewords"five hundreddollars' and substituting
thewords"fivethousand dollarsand by deleting " six months' and
substituting the words "twelve months'.

Amendment of 14. Section900f the principal Actisamended by deletingthe

Section 90. words "not exceeding fifteen hundred dollars' and substituting
the words "five thousand dollars" and by deleting the words"six
months' and substituting the words "twelve months'.

Passedthe Houseof Representativesthis Passed the Senatethis 27th day
14th day of November, 1995. of November, 1995.
B. Harris, M. Percival,
Speaker. President.
S. Walker, S. Walker,
Clerk to the House of Representatives. Clerk to the Senate.

Printed at the Government Printing Office, Antiguaand Barbuda,
by Rupert Charity, Government Printer,
—By Authority, 1996.
800-—1.96 [Price$3.30]





