BERMUDA

MOTOR CAR INSURANCE (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) AND PUBLIC CARRIAGE
AMENDMENT ACT 2022

2022 :1

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Motor Car Insurance (Third-Party Risks)
Act 1943 and the Public Carriage Act 1949 to increase the insurer liability for any person
travelling in a motor car or public carriage; to increase the insurer liability for any one claim
by any one person; and to increase the insurer liability for the total claims for any one
accident for each vehicle involved;

Be it enacted by The Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice and
consent of the Senate and the House of Assembly of Bermuda, and by the authority of the
same, as follows:

Citation

1 This Act may be cited as the Motor Car Insurance (Third-Party Risks) and Public
Carriage Amendment Act 2022.

Amends the Motor Car Insurance (Third-Party Risks) Act 1943

2 The Motor Car Insurance (Third-Party Risks) Act 1943 is amended in section 4(1)
(b)—

(@) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting “$125,000” and substituting “$375,0007;
(b) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting “S125,000” and substituting “$375,0007;
(c) in subparagraph (iv) by deleting “$500,000” and substituting “$750,000".

Amends the Public Carriage Act 1949

3 The Public Carriage Act 1949 is amended in paragraph 4(1)(b) of the Schedule
(Modification of Motor Car Insurance (Third Party Risks) Act 1943 as applied to public
carriages)—




MOTOR CAR INSURANCE (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) AND PUBLIC CARRIAGE
AMENDMENT ACT 2022

(@) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting “$125,000” and substituting “$375,0007;
(b) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting “S125,000” and substituting “$375,0007;
(c) in subparagraph (iv) by deleting “$500,000” and substituting “$750,000".

[Assent Date: 27 February 2022]

[Operative Date: 27 February 2022]




