
EXTRAORDINARY

OFFICIAL GAZETTE 
THE BAHAMAS

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

NASSAU 1st July, 2015 (A)



CUSTOMS MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS, 2015

Arrangement of Regulations
Regulation

1. Citation and commencement...................................................................................2
2. Amendment of paragraph 91 of the principal Regulations.....................................2
3. Amendment of paragraph 93 of the principal Regulations.....................................2
4. Insertion of new regulation 150 into the principal Regulations............................. 2
5. Insertion of new Third Schedule into the principal Regulations............................ 3



S.I. No. 46 of 2015

CUSTOM MANAGEMENT ACT

(NO. 32 of 2011)

CUSTOMS MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS, 2015

The Minister in exercise of the powers conferred by section 354 and 355 makes 
the following Regulations—

1. Citation and commencement.
(1) These Regulations, may be cited as the Customs Management 

(Amendment) Regulations, 2015.
(2) These Regulations shall come into force on the 1“ day of July, 2015.

2. Amendment of paragraph 91 of the principal Regulations.
Regulation 91(1) of the principal Regulations is amended

(a) m paragraph (a), by deleting the words and figures “two hundred 
and fifty dollars ($250.00)" and substituting therefor the words and 
figures “one hundred and fifty dollars ($150.00)’’;

(b) in paragraph (b), by deleting the words and figures “four hundred 
dollars ($400.00)” and substituting therefor the words and figures 
"three hundred dollars ($300.00)”.

3. Amendment of paragraph 93 of the principal Regulations.
Regulation 93(1) of the principal Regulations is amended in paragraph (b)(ii), by
deleting the words and figures “one thousand dollars ($1000.00) and substituting 
therefor the words and figures “five hundred dollars ($500.00)”.

4. Insertion of new regulation 150 into the principal Regulations.
The principal Regulations arc amended by inserting immediately after regulation 
149, the following new regulation—

“150. Fuel Surchage and Security Fees.
(1) There is payable on the goods specified in the first 

column of the Third Schedule the surcharge or fees 
specified in the second column of that Schedule.

Page - 2



(2) The Minister may amend the Third Schedule by 
Order.”.

5. Insertion of new Third Schedule into the principal Regulations.

The principal Regulations are amended by inserting immediately after the 
Second Schedule, the following new Schedule —

"TIIIRD SCHEDULE (Regulation 150)

GOODS FEE/SURCHARGE

Imported fuel, not including aviation 
fuel

1 cent per gallon

Every container imported into The 
Bahamas

$ 10 per twenty-foot 
equivalent unit

Every container exported front The 
Bahamas

$ 10 per twenty-foot 
equivalent unit

Every motor vehicle imported into 
The Bahamas

$10

Every motor vehicle exported from 
The Bahamas

$10.00

Dated this 30th day of June, 2015.

Signed 
PERRY G. CHRISTIE 

Minister responsible for Finance

Page - 3


