


[No. ]

Enactments

Bail Act

Section 15

New Section
21A

Coroners Act

Section 22D

Section 23(1)

Section23(3)

New Section 35

Corruption
Prevention Act

Section 15

Criminal Justice
(Administration)
Act

Section 33(1)

The Law Reform (Amendment of Penalties) Act, 2019

SCHEDULE (Section 2)
Amendments of Enactments

Amendments

Delete the words “five hundred thousand” and
substitute therefor the words “two million”.

Insert next after section 21 the following as section
21A—

“Minister 21A. The Minister may, by order
may ”l"‘end subject to affirmative resolution,
monetary .
penalties, amend the monetary penalties

specified under this Act.”.

Delete the words “five thousand™ and substitute
therefor the words “one hundred thousand”.

Delete the words “four thousand” and substitute
therefor the words “ten thousand”.

Delete the words “four thousand” and substitute
therefor the words “two hundred and fifty thousand”.

Insert next after section 34 the following as section 35—

“Minister 35. The Minister may, by order
may amend subiect to affirmative resolution,
monetary 3 mend the monetary penalties
penalties.

specified under this Act.”,

Delete subsection (2).

1. Delete the word “twenty” and substitute therefor the
words “one million”,

2. Delete the word “month”™ and substitute therefor the
word “year”.






[No. 1 The Law Reform (Amendment of Penalties) Act, 2019

Enactments

Section 22(5)

Section 22(10)

Enquiry into
Causes of Fire
and Accidents
Act

Section 7

New section 12

Amendments of Enactments

Amendments

conviction for such offence, to a fine not
exceeding three million dollars or to
imprisonment for a term not-exceeding
three years, or to both such fine and
imprisonment and in the case of a second
or subsequent conviction for such
offence, to a fine not exceeding five million
dollars or to imprisonment for a term not
exceeding five years or to both such fine
and imprisonment.”.

Delete subsection (5) and substitute therefor the
following—

3

(5) Every person who commits an offence
against this Act for which no penalty is otherwise
provided shall, on summary conviction before a
Judge of the Parish Court, be liable to a fine not
exceeding two million dollars or to imprisonment
for a term not exceeding two years, or to both
such fine and imprisonment.”.

Delete subsection (10)(b) and substitute therefor the
following—

“ (b) shall be liable to a fine which shall not
exceed one million dollars;”.

1. Delete the words “twenty dollars” and substitute
therefor the words “one million dollars”.

2. Delete the words “one month” and substitute
therefor the words “six months”.

Insert next after section 11 the following as section 12—

“ Minister 12. The Minister may, by order
may amend gybject to affirmative resolution,
monetary d th X i
penalties. ~ 3MeN e monetary penalties

specified under this Act.”.






[No. 1 The Law Reform (Amendment of Penalties) Act, 2019

Amendments of Enactments

Enactments Amendments
New section Insert next after section 21 the following as section
21A 21A—
“Minister 21A. The Minister may, by order

may a(me"d subject to affirmative resolution,
monetary 2 mend the monetary penalties
Y P

penalties. . ;
specified under this Act.”.
Judicature
(Parish Courts)
Act
Section 52 Delete the word “twenty” and substitute therefor the
words “one million”.
Section 55 Delete the word “twenty” and substitute therefor the
words “one hundred thousand”.
Section 58 Delete the word “twenty” and substitute therefor the
words “two million”.
Section 60 1. Delete the words “one hundred” and substitute
therefor the words *“one million”.
2. Delete the word “two” and substitute therefor the
word “six”.
Section 104 Delete the word “forty” and substitute therefor the
words “two hundred thousand”.
Section 160 Delete the word “twenty” and substitute therefor the

words “one million”.

Section 179(4) Delete subsection (4) and substitute therefor the
following—

M

(4) Where a juror summoned pursuant to this
section fails to attend or, having been chosen as
a juror, upon attendance refuses to be sworn, the
Court may—

(a) impose upon the person a fine not
exceeding ten thousand dollars; or

(b) in default of payment of the fine
referred to in paragraph (a), order the












[No. 1 The Law Reform (Amendment of Penalties) Act, 2019

Enactments

Malicious Injuries
to Property Act

Section 20(2)

Section 23

Section 24

Section 25

Section 29

Section 31(a)

Section 32(1)

Section 43

New section 60

Muslim Marriage
Act

Section 10(4)

Amendments of Enactments

Amendments

Delete the words “ten thousand dollars or three times
the value of the injury done, whichever is the greater”
and substitute therefor the words “one million dollars”.

Delete the word “four” and substitute therefor the words
“five hundred”.

Delete the word *‘four” and substitute therefor the words
“five hundred thousand”.

Delete the word *‘four” and substitute therefor the words
“five hundred”.

Delete the word “four” and substitute therefor the words
“two hundred and fifty thousand”.

Delete the words “two thousand dollars or three times
the value of the thing killed, maimed or wounded,
whichever is greater” and substitute therefor the words
“three million dollars”.

Delete the words “forty thousand” and substitute
therefor the words “three million”.

Delete the words “twenty thousand” and substitute
therefor the words “one million™.

Insert next after section 59 the following as section 60—

“Minister 60. The Minister may, by order
may amend subject to affirmative resolution,
monetary .
penalties. ~amend the monetary penalties

specified under this Act.”.

Delete the word “twenty” and substitute therefor the
words “one hundred thousand”.












