THE FINANCE ACT 2005

Act No. 14 of 2005 

I assent

A.R. BUNDHUN

Acting President of the Republic

20th April 2005

_____________

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Section

1. Short title 

2. Banking Act 2004 amended 

3. Bank of Mauritius Act 2004 amended 

4. Building Act amended 

5. Companies Act 2001 amended 

6. Consumer Protection (Price and Supplies Control) Act amended 

7. Cooperative Societies Act amended 

8. Customs Act amended 

9. Customs Tariff Act amended 

10. Environment Protection Act 2002 amended 

11. Excise Act amended 

12. Fair Trading Act amended 

13. Financial Intelligence and Anti-Money Laundering Act 2002 amended 

14. Financial Services Development Act 2001 amended 

15. Food and Agricultural Research Council Act amended 
16. Freeport Act 2004 amended 

17. Hire Purchase and Credit Sale Act amended 

18. Horse Racing Board Act 2003 amended 

19. Income Tax Act amended 

20. Investment Promotion Act amended 

21. Land (Duties and Taxes) Act amended 

22. Mutual Assistance in Criminal and Related Matters Act 2003 amended 

23. National Solidarity Fund Act amended 

24. Pensions Act amended 

25. Prevention of Corruption Act 2002 amended 

26. Prevention of Terrorism Act 2002 amended 

27. Registration Duty Act amended 

28. Sugar Industry Efficiency Act 2001 amended 

29. Sugar Industry Pension Fund Act amended 

30. Sugar Industry Pension Fund Rules 1955 amended 

31. Tobacco Production and Marketing Act amended 

32. Unified Revenue Act amended 

33. Value Added Tax Act amended 

34. Validation of resolution 

35. Repeal and savings 

36. Commencement 

__________________ 

AN ACT 

To provide for the implementation of measures announced in the Budget Speech and for the strengthening and streamlining of certain provisions relating mainly to revenue and public finance 

ENACTED by the Parliament of Mauritius as follows - 

1.
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Finance Act 2005. 

2.
Banking Act 2004 amended 

The Banking Act 2004 is amended - 

(a)
in section 7(6)(a) – 

(i)
in subparagraph (i), by adding immediately after the words “the licensee;” , the word “and”; 

(ii)
by repealing subparagraph (ii), the existing subparagraph (iii) being renumbered (ii); 

(b)
in section 14 - 

(i)
by deleting the heading and replacing it by the following heading - 

14.
Granting of licences to cash dealers 

(ii)
in subsection (1), by deleting the words “, for a cash dealer licence” and replacing them by the words “for a foreign exchange dealer licence or a money-changer licence, as the case may be”; 

(c)
in section 33(3)(c), by deleting the words “, in Mauritius,”; 

(d)
in section 59, by deleting the words “a bank” and “the bank” wherever they appear and replacing them by the words “a financial institution” and “the financial institution” respectively. 

3.
Bank of Mauritius Act 2004 amended 

The Bank of Mauritius Act 2004 is amended - 

(a)
in section 25(1), by deleting the words “provide advice to the Bank in the discharge of its functions” and replacing them by the words “provide such services to the Bank as it thinks fit”; 

(b)
in section 32(7)(a), by deleting the words “annual report and”. 

4.
Building Act amended 

The Building Act is amended in section 8, by adding immediately after paragraph (d), the following new paragraph, the full stop at the end of paragraph (d) being deleted and replaced by a semicolon - 

(e)
in respect of a building having more than 3 levels, plans referred to in paragraph (b) and showing in addition that the proposed construction makes provision for adequate parking space. 
5.
Companies Act 2001 amended 

The Companies Act 2001 is amended - 

(a)
in section 2(1), in the definition of “banking company”, by deleting the words “Banking Act 1988” and replacing them by the words “Banking Act 2004”; 

(b)
in section 221 – 

(i)
in subsection (1), by repealing paragraph (e) and replacing it by the following paragraphs - 

(e)
state, with respect to the accounting period, the amount which represents the total of the remuneration and benefits received, or due and receivable, from the company by - 

(i)
executive directors of the company engaged in the full-time or part-time employment of the company, including all bonuses and commissions receivable by them as employees; and 

(ii)
in a separate statement, non-executive directors of the company, 

(ea)
state, in the case of a holding company, with respect to the accounting period, the amount which represents the total of the remuneration and benefits received, or due and receivable, from the holding company and from its subsidiaries by - 

(i)
executive directors of the holding company engaged in the full-time or part-time employment of the holding company, including all bonuses and commissions receivable by them as employees; and 

(ii)
in a separate statement, non-executive directors of the holding company, 

(ii)
in subsection (3), by inserting immediately after the words “in relation to”, the words “each of”; 

(c)
in section 241(2), by deleting the words “Banking Act 1988” and replacing them by the words “Banking Act 2004”. 
6.
Consumer Protection (Price and Supplies Control) Act amended 

The Consumer Protection (Price and Supplies Control) Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 2 - 

(i)
by deleting the definition of “Court” and replacing it by the following definition - 

“Court” means the Profiteering Court, the Intermediate Court or a District Court; 

(ii)
by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical order, the following new definition - 

“Profiteering Court” means the Profiteering Division of the Supreme Court, established under section 29; 

(b)
by repealing section 20 and replacing it by the following section - 

20.
Obligation to keep records for the purposes of costing and mark-up 

(1)
Every trader who imports or manufactures controlled goods shall, in respect of those goods, keep, at all times, a full and true written record, whether electronically or otherwise, in the English or French language, showing - 

(a)
how the cost of the goods imported or manufactured has been arrived at; 

(b)
the selling price of those goods and the mark-up; and 

(c)
the stock of the goods. 

(2)
Every record under subsection (1) shall be kept for a period of at least 5 years after the completion of the transaction to which it relates. 

(3)
Any person who fails to comply with this section shall commit an offence. 
(c)
in section 21 - 

(a)
in subsection (1), by deleting the words “the register” and replacing them by the words “the records under section 20”; 

(b)
in subsections (2) and (4)(a), by deleting the word “register” wherever it appears and replacing it by the word “records”. 

(d)
in Part V, by deleting the heading and replacing it by the following heading - 

PART V – PROSECUTION BEFORE COURT 

(e)
in section 29 - 

(i)
by deleting the heading “Establishment of the Court” and replacing it by the following heading – 

29.
Jurisdiction of Courts 

(ii)
by repealing subsection (1) and replacing it by the following subsection – 

(1)
There is established, for the purposes of this Act, a division of the Supreme Court to be known as the Profiteering Court, which shall have jurisdiction to try any person charged with an offence under this Act and the Fair Trading Act. 

(iii)
in subsections (2) to (4), by deleting the word “Court” wherever it appears and replacing it by the words “Profiteering Court”; 

(iv)
by adding immediately after subsection (4), the following new subsection - 

(5)
Prosecution of an offence under this Act and the Fair Trading Act shall take place, at the discretion of the Director of Public Prosecutions, before the Profiteering Court, the Intermediate Court or a District Court. 

(f)
in section 30 – 

(i)
in subsections (1) to (4), by deleting the word “Court” wherever it appears and replacing it by the words “Profiteering Court”; 
(ii)
by adding immediately after subsection (4), the following new subsection - 

(5)
The provisions of the District and Intermediate Courts (Criminal Jurisdiction) Act shall apply to all proceedings under this Act and the Fair Trading Act before the Intermediate Court and a District Court. 

(g)
in section 31(2) - 

(i)
by deleting the words “and 153” appearing immediately after the words “section 152”; 

(ii)
in paragraph (a), by deleting the words “not less than 10,000 rupees and”; 

(iii)
in paragraph (b), by deleting the words “not less than 25,000 rupees and”; 

(h)
in section 33 - 

(i)
by numbering the existing provision as subsection (1); 

(ii)
in subsection (1) as numbered, by deleting the words “judgment of the Court” and replacing them by the words “judgment of the Profiteering Court”; 

(iii)
by adding immediately after subsection (1) as numbered, the following new subsection - 

(2)
An appeal from a final judgment of the Intermediate Court or a District Court under this Act and the Fair Trading Act shall be subject to the same conditions and shall be conducted in the same manner as an appeal from the Intermediate Court or District Court to the Supreme Court under the District and Intermediate Courts (Criminal Jurisdiction) Act. 

(i)
in section 34, by deleting the word “Court” and replacing it by the words “Profiteering Court”; 

(j)
in section 35(2)(a) - 

(i)
by deleting the words “(vi)” appearing before the words “the giving of information”, and replacing them by the words “(vii)”; 

(ii)
by adding immediately after subparagraph (vii), the following new subparagraph - 

(viii)
the regulation and control of season sales, clearance sales, bargain sales or other sales, or product promotion; 

7.
Cooperative Societies Act amended 

The Cooperative Societies Act is amended in section 29(b), by deleting the words “except on a deed of transfer witnessing the transfer of a motor vehicle” and replacing them by the words “except on a declaration, or deed of transfer, of ownership of motor vehicles or trailers”. 

8.
Customs Act amended 

The Customs Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 127, by inserting immediately after subsection (1), the following new subsection- 

(1A)
Any examination under subsection (1) may include the physical or chemical testing of, the drilling into, or the dismantling of, the goods and may be facilitated by any means including the use of chemical substances, detector dogs, x-ray scanning or other imaging equipment, or other mechanical, electrical or electronic device. 

(b)
in section 160(2), by deleting the words “which shall not exceed 100,000 rupees” and replacing them by the words “not exceeding 200,000 rupees and to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 5 years”; 

(c)
in section 163 - 

(i)
in subsection (2), by inserting immediately after the words “a fine not exceeding 200,000 rupees”, the words “and to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 5 years”; 

(ii)
by adding immediately after subsection (3), the following new subsection – 

(4)
Regulations made under subsection (1) may provide for the regulation of exports of goods to the European Union and the issue of movement certificates EUR 1 and invoice declarations in connection therewith. 

9.
Customs Tariff Act amended 

The Customs Tariff Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 2(1), by deleting the definition of “scheduled territory”, the semi-colon at the end of the definition of “public contractor” being deleted and replaced by a full stop; 

(b)
in section 3, by repealing subsection (2) and replacing it by the following subsection – 

(2)
For the purpose of levying customs duty under subsection (1), the rates of customs duties specified in Part 1 of the First Schedule shall apply to all imported goods. 

(c)
by repealing the Second Schedule. 

10.
Environment Protection Act 2002 amended 

The Environment Protection Act 2002 is amended - 

(a)
in section 65 – 

(i)
by deleting the full stop at the end of the definition of “manager” and replacing it by a semicolon; 

(ii)
by adding immediately after the definition of “manager”, the following new definition - 

“month” includes part of a month. 

(b)
in section 66, by repealing subsections (2) and (3) and replacing them by the following subsections - 

(2)
The manager of every designated establishment specified in Column 1 of the Fifth Schedule shall, after the end of every month, pay to the Director on its monthly turnover in respect of that month, a fee at the corresponding rate specified in Column 2 of that Schedule within the period specified in Column 3 of that Schedule. 

(3)
Where a designated establishment ceases its activity, the fee calculated under subsection (2) shall be paid within 7 days of the date of cessation of its activities. 

(c)
by repealing section 68 and replacing it by the following section - 

68.
Surcharge for late payment of fee 

(1)
Where a manager fails to pay any fee chargeable under section 66 on the last day on which it is payable, he shall be liable to pay to the Director, in addition to the fee chargeable, a surcharge of - 

(a)
10 per cent of the fee for the first month or part of the month during which the fee remains unpaid; and 

(b)
2 per cent of the fee chargeable under section 66 for each subsequent month or part of the month during which the fee remains unpaid, 

up to a maximum of 100 per cent of the fee. 

(2)
The Director may waive the whole or part of the surcharge under subsection (1) where he is satisfied that the failure to pay the fee chargeable under section 66 within the specified period was attributable to a just or reasonable cause. 

(d)
in the Fifth Schedule, by deleting the words “(Section 65)” and replacing them by the words “(sections 65 and 66)”. 

11.
Excise Act amended 

The Excise Act is amended – 

(a)
in section 25(2), by repealing paragraph (c) and replacing it by the following paragraph - 

(c)
require, where applicable, a licensee to equip his factory - 

(i)
with a flowmeter to record the flow of excisable goods; 

(ii)
where excisable goods are bottled, with an apparatus or equipment to record the number of bottles. 

(b)
in the First Schedule - 

(i)
by deleting the items and the corresponding entries relating to those items, specified in Part A of the Schedule to this Act; 

(ii)
by inserting in their appropriate numerical places, the items and the corresponding entries relating to those items, specified in Part B of the Schedule to this Act. 

12.
Fair Trading Act amended 

The Fair Trading Act is amended in section 13, by deleting the words “of not less than 10,000 rupees and”. 

13.
Financial Intelligence and Anti-Money Laundering Act 2002 amended 

The Financial Intelligence and Anti-Money Laundering Act 2002 is amended - 

(a)
in section 2 - 

(i)
by deleting the definitions of “bank”, “Bank of Mauritius”, and “cash dealer” and replacing them by the following definitions - 

“bank” - 

(a)
has the same meaning as in the Banking Act 2004; and 

(b)
includes any person licensed under the Banking Act 2004 to carry on deposit taking business; 

“Bank of Mauritius” means the Bank of Mauritius established under the Bank of Mauritius Act 2004; 

“cash dealer” has the same meaning as in the Banking Act 2004; 

(ii)
in the definition of “relevant enactments”, by deleting the words “the Banking Act, the Bank of Mauritius Act” and replacing them by the words “the Banking Act 2004, the Bank of Mauritius Act 2004”; 

(b)
in section 18(2), by repealing paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) and replacing them by the following paragraphs - 

(a)
in the case of a bank, proceed against it under sections 11 and 17 of the Banking Act 2004 on the ground that it is carrying on business in a manner which is contrary to the interest of the public; 

(b)
in the case of a cash dealer or a person licensed to carry on deposit taking business, proceed against him under sections 16 and 17 of the Banking Act 2004 on the ground that he is carrying on business in a manner which is contrary to the interest of the public. 

14.
Financial Services Development Act 2001 amended 

The Financial Services Development Act 2001 is amended - 

(a)
in section 7, by repealing subsection (7); 

(b)
in section 21(2)(c), by deleting the words “the Stock Exchange established under the Stock Exchange Act 1988” and replacing them by the words “a securities exchange licensed under the Securities Act 2005”; 

(c)
in section 26, by adding immediately after subsection (4), the following new subsection - 

(5)
The Commission may exempt any class of corporation holding a Category I Global Business Licence from the requirement of subsection (2). 

(d)
in section 27 - 

(i)
in subsection (2)(c), by deleting the words “the Stock Exchange Act 1988” and replacing them by the words “the relevant Acts”; 

(ii)
in subsection (5), by deleting the words “directions, rules and guidelines referred to in section 15” and replacing them by the words “directions given, rules made, standards set, and guidelines provided, by the Commission”. 

15.
Food and Agricultural Research Council Act amended 

The Food and Agricultural Research Council Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 4, by inserting immediately after paragraph (c), the following new paragraph, the word “and” at the end of paragraph (c) being deleted - 

(ca)
promote hydroponics, tissue culture and such other food and agricultural technologies as may be approved by the Minister; and 

(b)
in section 5 – 

(i)
by deleting the heading and replacing it by the following heading – 

5.
Functions and powers of the Council 

(ii) by numbering the existing provision as subsection (1); 

(iii) in subsection (1) as numbered, by inserting immediately after paragraph (d), the following new paragraph, the word “and” at the end of paragraph (d) being deleted - 

(da)
set up and manage greenhouses, hydroponics centres and other infrastructure for the purposes of promoting hydroponics and other agricultural technologies; and 

(iv)
by adding immediately after subsection (1) as numbered, the following subsection - 

(2)
For the purposes of subsection (1), the Council may - 

(a)
with the approval of the Minister, raise such loan as may be required to finance the setting up of greenhouses, hydroponics centres and other infrastructure; 

(b)
rent out greenhouses, hydroponics centres and other infrastructure on such terms and conditions as it may determine; and 

(c)
levy fees in respect of services in connection with greenhouses, hydroponics centres and other infrastructure and of transfer of any other food and agricultural technologies. 

(c)
in section 12(2), by inserting immediately after paragraph (a), the following new paragraph - 

(aa)
rental for greenhouses, hydroponics centres and other infrastructure and fees in respect of services in connection therewith and for the transfer of any other food and agricultural technologies; 

16.
Freeport Act 2004 amended 

The Freeport Act 2004 is amended in section 16(2), by deleting the words “Any goods or services supplied to a licensee by a registered person under the Value Added Tax Act” and replacing them by the words “Any goods or services, other than those specified in section 21(2) of, and the First Schedule to, the Value Added Tax Act, which are supplied to a licensee by a registered person under that Act”. 

17.
Hire Purchase and Credit Sale Act amended 

The Hire Purchase and Credit Sale Act is amended in section 2, by deleting the definition of “hire purchase agreement” and replacing it by the following definition - 

“hire purchase agreement” – 

(a)
means an agreement for the sale of goods under which the property in the goods shall pass to the hirer upon payment by instalments of the whole amount due; and 

(b)
includes any credit or financing agreement with a lending and financing agency for the purchase of goods; 

18.
Horse Racing Board Act 2003 amended 

The Horse Racing Board Act 2003 is amended - 

(a)
in section 13(1) - 

(i)
in paragraph (a), by repealing subparagraph (ii); 

(ii)
in paragraph (b) - 

(A)
by repealing subparagraph (i); 

(B)
in subparagraph (iii), by deleting the words “subparagraphs (i) and (ii)” and replacing them by the words “subparagraph (i)”; 

(b)
in section 17, by repealing subsection (4) and replacing it by the following subsection - 

(4)
No licence under this Act shall be issued or renewed where the person applying for the licence has failed to pay any duty or tax, or to furnish the required securities, under this Act. 

(c)
in section 19(1) - 

(i)
in paragraph (f), by deleting the words “fee, charge, duty or tax” and replacing them by the words “fee or charge”; 

(ii)
by inserting immediately after paragraph (f), the following new paragraph - 

(fa)
the licensee fails to pay any duty or tax, or to furnish the required securities, under this Act; 

(d)
in section 33 - 

(i)
in subsection (1), by deleting the words “fees, charges, duty or tax payable under this Act” and replacing them by the words “fees or charges payable under this Act”; 

(ii)
by adding immediately after subsection (2), the following new subsection - 

(3)
The Commissioner may, for the purposes of securing payment of any duty or tax payable under this Act, require a bookmaker or operator of a totalisator to furnish security in the form of a bank guarantee in such amount as the Commissioner thinks fit. 

(e)
in section 35(2)(b), by deleting the words “fees, charges, duty or tax payable under this Act” and replacing them by the words “fees or charges payable under this Act”; 

(f)
in section 36 - 

(i)
in subsection (1), by deleting the words “remit that amount to the Board together with a statement, in such form and manner as may be approved by the Board, containing such particulars as may be required” and replacing them by the words “remit that amount to the National Solidarity Fund established under the National Solidarity Fund Act”; 

(ii)
by repealing subsection (2) and replacing it by the following subsection - 

(2)
The operator of a totalisator shall, within 7 days of a race meeting, remit to the National Solidarity Fund established under the National Solidarity Fund Act, the fraction of a rupee not paid to winning punters in respect of that meeting. 

(iii)
by repealing subsection (3); 

(g)
in section 40, by adding immediately after subsection (5), the following new subsections - 

(6)
A person lodging written representations under subsection (5) shall, upon lodging the representations – 

(a)
pay to the Commissioner 30 per cent of the amount of duty and tax claimed in the notice of assessment; or 

(b)
furnish to the Commissioner a security in the form of a bank guarantee for that amount. 

(7)
Where an assessment is reduced in accordance with a decision of the Assessment Review Committee, any amount of duty and tax paid under subsection (6) in excess of the amount payable in accordance with that decision shall be refunded together with interest at the prevailing Bank rate, free of income tax, from the date on which the payment is received by the Commissioner to the date on which it is refunded. 

19.
Income Tax Act amended 

The Income Tax Act is amended – 

(a)
in section 2, by deleting the definition of “non-resident” and replacing it by the following definition - 

“non-resident” – 

(a)
for the purposes of sections 6(4)(b), 161A(1)(g) and paragraph (iv) of item 14 of Part II, and items 5 and 6 of Part III, of the Second Schedule, and the Income Tax (Foreign Tax Credit) Regulations 1996 in so far as they apply to a bank holding a banking licence under the Banking Act 2004 - 

(i)
in the case of an individual, means a person - 

(A)
whose permanent place of abode is outside Mauritius; and 

(B)
who is outside Mauritius at the time the services are supplied; 

(ii)
in the case of any other person - 

(A)
means a person whose centre of economic interest is located outside Mauritius; and 

(B)
includes a company incorporated in Mauritius in so far as its banking transactions carried out through a permanent establishment outside Mauritius are concerned; but 

(C)
does not include a company incorporated outside Mauritius in so far as its banking transactions carried out through a permanent establishment in Mauritius are concerned; 

(b)
in any other case, means a person who is not resident in Mauritius; 

(b)
in section 18, by adding immediately after subsection (4), the following new subsection – 

(5)
Subject to subsection (1) and section 26(1)(b) and (3), where any expenditure or loss incurred by a bank is not directly attributable to either its income derived from Mauritius or its foreign source income, the bank shall forward, together with its return of income which is required to be furnished under this Act, a certificate from a qualified auditor certifying that such expenditure or loss has been apportioned in a fair and reasonable manner, after taking into account any expenditure or loss incurred in the production of exempt income. 

(c)
in section 24(6), by deleting the words “or machinery” wherever they appear and replacing them by the words “, machinery or industrial premises”; 

(d)
in section 25(7)(a), by inserting immediately after subparagraph (i), the following new subparagraph - 

(ia)
where a person sells or otherwise transfers industrial premises to a relative or to a related company and the premises sold or transferred are used by the relative or the related company as industrial premises; 

(e)
in section 28(1)(a), by deleting the words “125,000 rupees” and replacing them by the words “135,000 rupees”; 

(f)
in section 36(1)(a), by adding immediately after the words “Stock Exchange”, the words “, or of an authorised mutual fund”; 

(g)
in section 37(2) - 

(i)
in paragraph (a), by deleting the words “20,000 rupees” and replacing them by the words “25,000 rupees”; 

(ii)
in paragraph (b), by deleting the words “30,000 rupees” and replacing them by the words “35,000 rupees”; 

(h)
in section 44A - 

(i)
by repealing subsections (1) and (2) and replacing them by the following subsections - 

(1)
Notwithstanding the other provisions of this Act, but subject to the other provisions of this section, where in the case of a company, the normal tax payable is less than 5 per cent of its book profit in an income year, the tax payable for that income year shall be deemed to be - 

(a)
5 per cent of its book profit in respect of that year; or 

(b)
10 per cent of the aggregate amount of any dividends declared and any amount distributed by way of shares in lieu of dividends in that year, 

whichever is lesser. 

(2)
This section shall not apply - 

(a)
to a company which is exempt from the payment of income tax; or 

(b)
where 10 per cent of the aggregate amount of any dividends declared and any amount distributed by way of shares in lieu of dividends by the company for the purposes of subsection (1) does not exceed the amount of the normal tax payable. 

(ii) in subsection (3), by deleting the words “subsection (4)(a)(i)” and replacing them by the words “subsection (4)(a)”; 

(iii) in subsection (4), in the definition of “book profit”- 

(A)
in paragraph (a)(ii), by inserting immediately after the word “disposal”, the words “or revaluation”; 

(B)
in paragraph (a)(iii), by inserting immediately after the word “sale”, the words “or revaluation”; 

(C)
in paragraph (b)(i), by inserting immediately after the word “disposal”, the words “or revaluation”; 

(D)
in paragraph (b)(ii), by inserting immediately after the word “sale”, the words “or revaluation”; 

(i)
in section 49(4)(a), by deleting the words “under the Investment Promotion Act; and” and replacing them by the words “, or export service enterprise, under the Investment Promotion Act or to a duty free shop under the Customs Act; and”; 

(j)
in section 59A – 

(i)
in the heading, by adding immediately after the word “takeover”, the words “or merger”; 

(ii)
by repealing subsection (1) and replacing it by the following subsection – 

(1)
Notwithstanding the other provisions of this Act, where – 

(a)
a company takes over another company engaged in manufacturing activities; or 

(b)
2 or more companies engaged in manufacturing activities merge into one company, 

any unrelieved loss of the acquiree may be transferred to the acquirer in the income year in which the takeover or merger takes place, on such conditions relating to safeguard of employment as may be approved by the Minister. 

(iii)
by repealing subsections (3) and (4) and replacing them by the following subsections – 

(3)
Where, at any time before the expiry of 3 years from the date of the takeover or merger, more than 50 per cent of the number of employees of the acquiree taken over by the acquirer or of the employees of both the acquiree and the acquirer, as the case may be, are made redundant, any loss transferred under subsection (1) shall be withdrawn and the amount of the loss so withdrawn shall be deemed to be the gross income of the acquirer in the income year in which the employees are made redundant. 

(4)
For the purposes of this section - 

“acquiree” means a company of which the assets and liabilities have been acquired by another company through a takeover or merger and which is dissolved; 

“acquirer” means a company which has acquired the assets and liabilities of another company by means of a takeover or merger. 

(k)
in section 69 - 

(i)
in subsection (1), by inserting immediately after the words “equity fund”, the words “or an authorised mutual fund”; 

(ii)
in subsection (3)(c), by deleting the words “, other than an authorised mutual fund,”; 

(l)
in section 69A - 

(i)
in the heading, by deleting the words “spinning companies” and replacing them by the words “qualifying companies”; 

(ii)
in subsections (1), (4) and (5)(b) and (c), by deleting the words “spinning company” and replacing them by the words “qualifying company”; 

(iii)
by adding immediately after subsection (6), the following new subsection - 

(7)
For the purposes of this section, “qualifying company” means a company set up for the purpose of operating a spinning, weaving or dyeing factory. 

(m)
by inserting immediately after section 117, the following new section - 

117A.
Basis of assessment on commencement of business 

(1)
Any person engaged in business and required to submit a return under section 112 or 116 shall, in respect of the commencement year of income, submit a return for a period not exceeding 12 months ending with the date of the annual balance of his accounts. 

(2)
Where the annual balance of the accounts ends on a date other than 30 June, that date shall be deemed to be an approved return date for the purposes of section 116(2) and the return submitted under subsection (1) shall be deemed to have been made in relation to the income year ending on 30 June following that date. 

(3)
For the purposes of this section, “commencement year of income” means the income year in which the business of a person commences. 

(n)
by repealing section 118 and replacing it by the following section - 

118.
Approved return date 

(1)
Any person engaged in business opting for bona fide commercial reasons to change his return date shall apply to the Commissioner, within 3 months of the date of his last balance sheet, for approval of the change. 

(2)
The Commissioner shall not approve any change under this section where no return has been submitted under section 112 or 116 in respect of any of the last 3 income years. 

(3)
The Commissioner may approve or refuse to approve the change under this section and shall give notice of his decision to the applicant within 30 days of the date of receipt of the application under subsection (1). 

(4)
Where a change in return date is approved under this section, the basis on which the profit derived by the applicant from his business in the income year in which the return date is changed shall be computed in such manner as may be prescribed.  

(o)
by inserting immediately after section 159, the following new section - 

159A.
Statement of Practice 

The Commissioner shall, from time to time, issue and publish Statements of Practice in relation to the application of specific provisions of this Act. 

(p)
in the Second Schedule - 

(i)
in Part I, in item 33(a), by deleting the words “A company engaged in spinning,” and replacing them by the words “A company set up for the purpose of operating a spinning, weaving or dyeing factory,”; 

(ii)
in Part III, in item 3(f), by deleting the words “Banking Act 1988” and replacing them by the words “Banking Act 2004”; 

(q)
in the Third Schedule, by deleting the figures “80,000”, “65,000” and the figure “50,000” wherever they appear and replacing them by the figures “85,000”, “85,000” and “70,000” respectively. 

20.
Investment Promotion Act amended 

The Investment Promotion Act is amended in section 28A(1), by deleting the words “The Board may” and replacing them by the words “The Minister may”. 

21.
Land (Duties and Taxes) Act amended 

The Land (Duties and Taxes) Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 29(2), by inserting immediately after the words “to an ascendant” the words “, or to an ascendant and his spouse married under the legal community of goods and property,”; 

(b)
by adding immediately after section 50, the following new section - 

51. Transitional provisions 

A deed referred to in section 2(b)(ix) and (x) is deemed not to be included in the definition of “deed of transfer” where the deed is in respect of a société civile immobilière d’attribution duly registered prior to 26 August 2004 and holding a building permit under the Building Act relating to the construction for which the société has been constituted and which was issued prior to that date. 

22.
Mutual Assistance in Criminal and Related Matters Act 2003 amended 

The Mutual Assistance in Criminal and Related Matters Act 2003 is amended in section 15(2), by deleting the words “Notwithstanding section 9 of the Bank of Mauritius Act, sections 39 and 39A of the Banking Act” and replacing them by the words “Notwithstanding section 26 of the Bank of Mauritius Act 2004, section 64 of the Banking Act 2004”. 

23.
National Solidarity Fund Act amended 

The National Solidarity Fund Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 4, by inserting immediately after paragraph (a), the following new paragraph, the existing paragraph (b) being relettered (c) accordingly - 

(b)
to provide financial assistance to redundant workers; 

(b)
by inserting immediately after section 4, the following new section - 

4A.
Financial assistance to redundant workers 

(1) 
Every employer shall, not later than 31 July 2005, pay to the Fund, in respect of each insured person as at 30 June 2005, a contribution of 100 rupees.

(2)
Where an employer fails to pay the contribution under subsection (1), he shall be liable to pay, in addition to the contribution, a penalty representing 20 per cent of the contribution. 

(3)
The amount of any unpaid contribution and penalty under this section may be recovered by the Fund in the manner provided for the recovery of State debts under the Recovery of State Debts Act. 

(4)
The receiver, or receiver and manager, of a company under receivership, or the liquidator of a company under compulsory winding up, shall, as soon as practicable, after being appointed as such, give written notice to the Permanent Secretary - 

(a)
of the date of his appointment as receiver, or receiver and manager, or liquidator, as the case may be; 

(b)
specifying, in respect of each worker who has become redundant – 

(i)
his full name and address; 

(ii)
his last rate of pay; 

(iii)
whether he has been paid, will be paid, or will not be paid, remuneration or wages in lieu of notice, or severance allowance, or compensation for length of service, as the case may be. 

(5)
The notice given under subsection (4) shall be in a form approved by the Permanent Secretary. 

(6)
Any person who fails to comply with subsection (4) shall commit an offence and shall, on conviction, be liable to a fine not exceeding 50,000 rupees. 

(7)
On receipt of a notice under subsection (4), the Permanent Secretary shall, in writing, notify the Board of the relevant particulars of the workers who have not been paid their remuneration or wages in lieu of notice or severance allowance or compensation for length of service, as the case may be. 

(8)
There shall be paid out of the Fund, a financial assistance of 6,000 rupees to every worker referred to in subsection (7), whom the Permanent Secretary certifies as being a worker to whom such financial assistance is payable. 

(9)
For the purposes of this section – 

“employer” has the same meaning as in the National Pensions Act; 

“insured person” means an insured person under section 13(1) of the National Pensions Act; 

“Permanent Secretary” means the Permanent Secretary of the Ministry responsible for the subject of labour; 

“worker” has the same meaning as in the Labour Act. 

24.
Pensions Act amended 

The Pensions Act is amended in section 2, in the definition of “pensionable office”, in paragraph (b), by deleting the words “studentship or cadetship” and replacing them by the words “studentship, cadetship or apprenticeship”. 

25.
Prevention of Corruption Act 2002 amended 

The Prevention of Corruption Act 2002 is amended in section 2, by deleting the definitions of “bank” and “cash dealer” and replacing them by the following definitions - 

“bank” - 

(a)
has the same meaning as in the Banking Act 2004; and 

(b)
includes any person licensed under the Banking Act 2004 to carry on deposit taking business; 

“cash dealer” has the same meaning as in the Banking Act 2004; 

26.
Prevention of Terrorism Act 2002 amended 

The Prevention of Terrorism Act 2002 is amended in section 2, by deleting the definitions of “bank” and “cash dealer” and replacing them by the following definitions - 

“bank” - 

(a)
has the same meaning as in the Banking Act 2004; and 

(b)
includes any person licensed under the Banking Act 2004 to carry on deposit taking business; 

“cash dealer” has the same meaning as in the Banking Act 2004; 

27.
Registration Duty Act amended 

The Registration Duty Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 3 - 

(i)
in subsection (2)(ii), by deleting the words “50 per cent” and replacing them by the words “10 per cent”; 

(ii) in subsection (5), by inserting immediately after paragraph (a)
the following new paragraph - 

(aa)
Notwithstanding subsections (1) and (2) and paragraph (a), the duty leviable on any deed witnessing the purchase of an immovable property by a manufacturing company shall be at the rate of 2.5 per cent provided that the deed is duly registered on or before 31 December 2007. 

(b)
in section 36(b), by adding immediately after subparagraph (x), the following new subparagraph, the full stop at the end of subparagraph (x) being deleted and replaced by a semicolon - 

(xi)
where the transfer is made by a divorcee to the other divorcee in respect of his share in a residential property used as their logement principal, a declaration from both divorcees that the residential property was used as their logement principal. 

(c)
in section 44A, by repealing subsection (3) and replacing it by the following subsection - 

(3)
The inscription under subsection (1) shall be erased - 

(a)
on payment of the duty; or 

(b)
only in respect of a lot in a building which is subject to a réglement de co-propriété in accordance with Articles 614-654 and 664-94 of the Code Civil Mauricien where the debtor has paid the duty in respect of that lot and makes such a request in writing. 

(d)
in the First Schedule, in Part I, in paragraph J, by deleting the words “Rate 12%” and replacing them by the words “Rate 10%”; 

(e)
in the Eighth Schedule, by adding after item 7, the following new item – 

8.
A company holding an investment certificate in respect of a hotel under the Investment Promotion Act. 

28.
Sugar Industry Efficiency Act 2001 amended 

The Sugar Industry Efficiency Act 2001 is amended – 

(a)
in section 10(8), by repealing paragraph (b); 

(b)
in section 14, by adding after subsection (8), the following new subsection - 

(9)
Where a person converts and sells land pursuant to section 29(1)(i), the deed containing the authorisation for land conversion and witnessing the transfer of the land shall be exempted from the payment of – 

(a)
the tax leviable under Part III and Part IV of the Land (Duties and Taxes) Act; 

(b)
the fee leviable under section 9 of the Morcellement Act; and 

(c)
the transcription duty leviable under the Transcription and Mortgage Act. 

(c)
in section 26 - 

(i)
in subsection (1) - 

(A)
at the end of paragraph (a), by deleting the word “or”; 

(B)
at the end of paragraph (b), after the words “pursuant to section 23”, by deleting the comma and replacing it by the words “; or”; 

(C)
by inserting immediately after paragraph (b), the following new paragraph - 

(c)
subject to subsection (3), to an occupier of a residential building erected - 

(i)
on land leased to him by the owner; or 

(ii)
on land occupied by him with the consent of the owner, 

(ii)
by adding immediately after subsection (2), the following new subsection - 

(3)     (a)
Subsection (1)(c) shall apply - 

(i)
where the lease or occupation, as the case may be, commenced before 1 January 2000; 

(ii) where the deed of transfer contains a certificate from the Mauritius Sugar Authority to the effect that the transfer is in accordance with subsection (1)(c); and 

(iii) up to 30 April 2006. 

(b)
For the purposes of subsection (1)(c), “owner” means a sugar estate or an agricultural estate. 

(d)
in section 28, by inserting immediately after subsection (7), the following new subsection - 

(7A)     (a)
The committee may co-opt as member the representative of any other Ministry or any other person, who, in the opinion of the committee, may assist it in the discharge of its functions and in expediting the processing of an application under this section. 

(b)
No co-opted member shall have the right to vote. 

(e)
in section 29 - 

(i)
in subsection (1) – 

(A)
in paragraph (a)(vi), by deleting the words “and business parks” and replacing them by the words “, business parks and shopping malls”; 

(B)
in paragraph (g), by deleting the word “or”; 

(C)
by deleting the full stop at the end of paragraph (h) and replacing it by the words “; or”; 

(D)
by adding after paragraph (h), the following new paragraph - 

(i)
where the applicant, being a planter owner of an extent of land not exceeding 4.221 hectares (10 arpents) and in respect of which a declaration under section 40 of the Sugar Insurance Fund Act is made, converts land of an extent not exceeding one hectare (2.3696 arpents), being - 

(i)
land in areas where, in accordance with strategic and detailed development policies of the relevant outline scheme or development plan, as the case may be, development is permissible; and 

(ii)
land other than land within an irrigation area. 

(f)
in the Twelfth Schedule, in Part II – 

(i)
in paragraph 9, by deleting the words “29(1)(d) and (g)” and replacing them by the words “29(1)(d), (g) and (i)”; 

(ii)
in paragraph 10, by deleting the words “5 years” and replacing them by the words “2 years”. 

29.
Sugar Industry Pension Fund Act amended 

The Sugar Industry Pension Fund Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 19- 

(i)
by numbering the existing provision as subsection (1); 

(ii)
by adding after subsection (1) as numbered, the following new subsections - 

(2)
The funds under the control and management of the Fund may be administered by a management company incorporated under the Companies Act 2001. 

(3)
The management company shall be wholly owned by the Fund. 

(4)
The objects of the management company shall be to - 

(a)
provide for pension administration, advisory and actuarial services; and 

(b)
carry out secretarial duties. 

(b)
in section 23(1) - 

(i)
at the end of paragraph (e), by deleting the word “and”; 

(ii)
by adding after paragraph (f), the following new paragraph, the full stop at the end of paragraph (f) being deleted and replaced by the words “; and”- 

(g)
in the securities of the management company referred to in section 19(2). 

30.
Sugar Industry Pension Fund Rules 1955 amended 

The Sugar Industry Pension Fund Rules 1955 are amended by inserting after rule 20, the following new rule - 

20A.
Delegation of secretarial duties 

The Board may delegate any of the duties pertaining to the funds under the control and management of the Fund under rule 20 to the management company referred to in section 19(2) of the Sugar Industry Pension Fund Act. 

31.
Tobacco Production and Marketing Act amended 

The Tobacco Production and Marketing Act is amended in section 9, by inserting immediately after paragraph (d), the following new paragraph - 

(e)
classify, in such manner as may be prescribed, cigarettes destined for sale on the local market into different categories; 

32.
Unified Revenue Act amended 

The Unified Revenue Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 2, by deleting the definitions of “Assessment Review Committee” and “Committee”; 

(b)
in section 8B(5) – 

(i)
by deleting the definitions of “Category 1 Banking Licence” and “Category 2 Banking Licence”; 

(ii)
in the definition of “large taxpayer”, by deleting paragraph (c) and replacing it by the following paragraph - 

(c)
does not include a corporation holding a Category 1 Global Business Licence; 

(c)
by repealing sections 8E and 8F. 

33.
Value Added Tax Act amended 

The Value Added Tax Act is amended - 

(a)
in section 2, by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical order, the following new definition- 

“non-resident”, for the purposes of section 21(2)(g) and (ga), item 50(a) of the First Schedule, item 6(b)(ii) of the Fifth Schedule and item 1 of Part II of the Tenth Schedule - 

(a)
in the case of an individual, means a person - 

(i)
whose permanent place of abode is outside Mauritius; and 

(ii)
who is outside Mauritius at the time the services are supplied; 

(b)
in the case of any other person - 

(i)
means a person whose centre of economic interest is located outside Mauritius; and 

(ii)
includes a company incorporated in Mauritius in so far as its banking transactions carried out through a permanent establishment outside Mauritius are concerned; but 

(iii)
does not include a company incorporated outside Mauritius in so far as its banking transactions carried out through a permanent establishment in Mauritius are concerned; 

(b)
in section 8(2), by deleting the words “administering this Act or any other revenue law” and replacing them by the words “this Act, any other revenue law, the Prevention of Corruption Act 2002”; 

(c)
in section 21- 

(i)
in subsection (2), by repealing paragraph (g) and replacing it by the following paragraphs – 

(g)
goods and services used by banks holding a banking licence under the Banking Act 2004 for providing banking services other than to non-residents and corporations holding a Global Business Licence under the Financial Services Development Act 2001; 

(ga)
banking services provided by banks holding a banking licence under the Banking Act 2004 other than to non-residents and corporations holding a Global Business Licence under the Financial Services Development Act 2001; and 

(ii)
in subsection (6), by deleting the words “input tax was paid.” and replacing them by the words “input tax ought to have been taken.”; 

(d)
in section 24(1), by deleting the words “ being building” and replacing them by the words “being building or structure”; 

(e)
in section 32(3) - 

(i)
in paragraph (a), by deleting the words “the Foreign Exchange Dealers Act” and by inserting the figure “2004” immediately after the word “Act” wherever it appears; 

(ii)
in paragraph (b), by adding at the end, the words “regulated by the Financial Services Development Act 2001; 

(f)
in section 37 - 

(i)
in subsection (1), by inserting immediately after the words “tax due and payable by that person”, the words “or of the excess amount to be carried forward in case the input tax exceeds the output tax”; 

(ii)
in subsection (4), by inserting after the words “amount of tax”, the words “or the reduction in the excess amount to be carried forward”; 

(g)
in section 38 - 

(i)
by repealing subsection (2) and replacing it by the following subsection - 

(2)
Any person who lodges an objection under subsection (1) shall - 

(a)
state, in his letter of objection, the grounds of objection and the adjustments that are required to be made and the reasons therefor; 

(b)
submit, at the time the objection is lodged, in respect of each of the taxable periods covered by the assessment, any return required under section 22 or any statement required under section 23; 

(c)
pay any amount of tax specified in the return or statement referred to in paragraph (b) together with any surcharge under section 26 and any penalty under sections 24(9) and 27; and 

(d)
in addition, pay the difference, if any, between 30 per cent of the amount of tax claimed in the notice of assessment and the amount of tax paid under paragraph (c). 

(ii)
by repealing subsection (5) and replacing it by the following subsection - 

(5)
Where the person fails to comply with subsection (2)(a) or (b), the objection shall be deemed to have lapsed and the Commissioner shall, within 28 days of the date of receipt of the letter of objection, give notice thereof to that person. 

(iii)
in subsection (6), by adding at the end, the words “or the excess amount as assessed shall be deemed to be the excess amount to be carried forward, as the case may be”; 

(h)
in section 39 - 

(i)
in subsection (3), by adding at the end, the words “or the excess amount as determined shall be carried forward, as the case may be”; 

(ii)
by inserting immediately after subsection (3), the following new subsection - 

(3A)
Where an assessment is reduced pursuant to a determination under subsection (2), any amount of tax paid under section 38(2)(d) in excess of the amount payable in accordance with that determination, shall be refunded, together with interest at the prevailing Bank rate, free of income tax, from the date the payment is received by the Commissioner to the date it is refunded. 

(i)
in the First Schedule - 

(i)
by deleting item 3 and replacing it by the following item - 

3.
Bread other than bread referred to in the Bread (Control of Manufacture and Sale) Regulations 1988. 

(ii)
by deleting item 44; 

(iii)
in item 47, by deleting the words “liable to Registration Duty under the Registration Duty Act”; 

(iv)
by deleting item 48 and replacing it by the following item- 

48.
The sale or transfer of an immovable property, a building or part of a building, flat or tenement, or the construction of a building or part of a building, flat or tenement (excluding repairs or renovation), used for residential purposes. 

(v)
in item 50(a), by deleting the words “(other than services supplied by holders of a Category 2 Banking Licence)” and replacing them by the words “(other than services supplied by a bank holding a banking licence under the Banking Act 2004 in respect of its banking transactions with non-residents and corporations holding a Global Business Licence under the Financial Services Development Act 2001)”; 

(vi)
by deleting item 51 and replacing it by the following item - 

51.
Buses of H.S Codes 8702.1011 and 8702.9011 and chassis for buses of H.S Code 8706.0011 operated under a road service licence and used for the transport of the general public. 

(j)
in the Fifth Schedule- 

(i)
in item 2 - 

(A)
by repealing paragraph (a) and replacing it by the following paragraph - 

(a)
wheat flour, wheat bran and bread referred to in the Bread (Control of Manufacture and Sale) Regulations 1988; 

(B)
by adding immediately after paragraph (p), the following new paragraph, the full stop at the end of paragraph (p) being deleted and replaced by a semi-colon - 

(q)
Kerosene including kerosene jet type fuel. 

(ii)
by adding at the end of item 5, the words “whose business premises are located in a freeport zone”; 

(iii)
in item 6(b) - 

(A)
in subparagraph (i), by deleting the words “ in respect of services supplied”; 

(B)
by repealing subparagraph (ii) and replacing it by the following subparagraph - 

(ii)
by a bank holding a banking licence under the Banking Act 2004 in respect of its banking transactions with non-residents and corporations holding a Global Business Licence under the Financial Services Development Act 2001. 

(iv)
by adding after item 8, the following new item - 

9.
Aeronautical services provided within an area at the airport, approved by the Director of Civil Aviation in respect of renting of spaces, hangarage and handling of aircrafts by an operator holding an investment certificate under the Investment Promotion Act. 

(k)
in the Ninth Schedule, by adding after item 10, the following new items – 

	11. 
	Any person approved by the Tertiary Education Commission established under the Tertiary Education Commission Act, as a person engaged in the provision of tertiary education. 


	
	Construction of a purpose-built building for the provision of tertiary education, as may be approved by the Tertiary Education Commission.

	12. 
	Any holder of a road service licence for the transport of the general public by bus. 
	
	Bus bodies built during the period up to 31 August 2007 on imported bus chassis.


(l)
in the Tenth Schedule, in Part II, by deleting item 1 and replacing it by the following item - 

1.
Banking by a company holding a banking licence under the Banking Act 2004 in respect of its banking transactions other than with non-residents and corporations holding a Global Business Licence under the Financial Services Development Act 2001 

34.
Validation of resolution 

The financial resolution adopted by the National Assembly on 4 April 2005 is validated. 

35.
Repeal and savings 

(1)
The following enactments are repealed - 

(a)
the Finance Act 1980; 

(b)
the Finance Act 1981; and 

(c)
the Shops Act. 

(2)
Notwithstanding subsection (1)(a) and (b)- 

(a)
no refund shall be made in respect of any surcharge paid under the repealed enactments before the coming into operation of this section on any tax in respect of a period expiring after the date of the coming into operation of this section; and 

(b)
where any tax due to be paid before the coming into operation of this section is paid after the coming into operation of this section, any surcharge payable under the repealed enactments on that tax shall remain payable. 

(3)
The Supreme Court shall, in respect of any appeal under the Tax Appeal Tribunal Act, repealed by section 24(1) of the Finance Act 2001 and pending before it, determine the questions of law arising in the case and may - 

(a)       (i)
affirm, reverse or amend the determination of the Tribunal ; or 

(ii)
remit the matter to the Assessment Review Committee, set up under the Unified Revenue Act, with its opinion on the matter, to be started anew; and 

(b) make such other order in the matter as it thinks fit. 

(4)
Any appeal made under section 8F of the Unified Revenue Act, which section is to be repealed by section 32(c) of this Act and pending before the Supreme Court shall be determined by the Supreme Court as if that section had not been repealed. 

36.
Commencement 

(1)
Sections 2, 3, 5(a) and (c), 13, 22, 25 and 26 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 10 November 2004. 

(2)
Section 7 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 26 August 2004. 

(3)
Section 11(b) shall be deemed to have come into operation on 5 April 2005. 

(4)
Subject to subsection (5), sections 14(a), (b) and (d)(i) and 32(a) and (c) shall come into operation on a date to be fixed by Proclamation. 

(5)
Different dates may be fixed for the coming into operation of different sections referred to in subsection (4). 

(6)
Section 19(a) shall come into operation as from the year of assessment commencing 1 July 2006. 

(7)
Section 19(c), (d), (h), (i), (j), (k), (l), (m) and (p)(i) shall come into operation as from the year of assessment commencing 1 July 2005. 

(8)
Section 19(e), (g) and (q) shall come into operation as from the income year commencing 1 July 2005. 

(9)
Section 19(f) shall be deemed to have come into operation as from the income year commencing 1 July 2004. 

(10)
Section 20 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 1 December 2004. 

(11)
Section 24 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 1 July 2003. 

(12)
Sections 27(d) and 35(1)(a) and (b) and (2) shall come into operation on 2 May 2005. 

(13)
Section 33(a), (c)(i), (e), (i)(v), (j)(iii) and (l) shall come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

Passed by the National Assembly on the nineteenth of April two thousand and five

Ram Ranjit Dowlutta

Clerk of the national Assembly

SCHEDULE

(section 11(b)) 

Part A 

PART I – EXCISABLE GOODS IMPORTED INTO MAURITIUS

	Head-ing No.
	H.S. Code
	Excisable goods
	Statistical Unit
	Taxable base
	Rate of excise duty
	Date payable

	22.08
	
	Undenatured ethyl alcohol of an alcoholic strength by volume of less than 80% vol; spirits, liqueurs and other spirituous beverages

- Whiskies:

--- Imported in bulk for bottling:
	
	
	
	

	
	2208.3011
	--- Of an alcoholic strength by volume not exceeding 55% vol
	L
	“
	Rs 100 per litre
	“

	
	2208.3012
	--- Of an alcoholic strength by volume exceeding 55% but not exceeding 70% vol
	L
	“
	Rs150 per litre
	“

	
	2208.3019
	--- Other

- Other


	L
	“
	Rs 200 per litre
	“

	
	2208.901
	--- Eau de vie
	L
	Value at importa-tion
	Rs 300 per litre
	“


PART B

PART 1 – EXCISABLE GOODS IMPORTED INTO MAURITIUS

	Column 1
	Column 2
	Column 3
	Column 4
	Column 5
	Column 6

	Heading No.
	H.S. Code
	Excisable goods
	Statistical Unit
	Taxable base
	Rate of excise duty
	Date payable

	22.08
	
	Undenatured ethyl alcohol of an alcoholic strength by volume of less than 80% vol; spirits, liqueurs and other spirituous beverages

- Whiskies:

--- Imported in bulk for bottling:
	
	
	
	

	
	2208.3011
	--- Of an alcoholic strength by volume not exceeding 55% vol
	L
	“
	Rs 200 per litre
	At the time the entry for the goods is validated in accordance with the Customs Act

	
	2208.3012
	--- Of an alcoholic strength by volume exceeding 55% but not exceeding 70% vol
	L
	“
	Rs 300 per litre
	“

	
	2208.3019
	--- Other

- Other

--- Eau de vie
	L
	“
	Rs 400 per litre
	“

	
	2208.9011
	--- Imported in bulk for bottling not exceeding 55% vol
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 200 per litre
	“

	
	2208.9012
	--- Imported in bulk for bottling, of an alcoholic strength by volume exceeding 55% but not exceeding 70% vol
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 300 per litre
	“

	
	2208.9013
	--- Imported in bulk for bottling, of an alcoholic strength by volume exceeding 70% vol
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 400 per litre
	“

	
	2208.9019
	--- Other
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 300 per litre
	“

	
	
	Tequilla:


	
	
	
	

	
	2208.9031
	--- Imported in bulk for bottling not exceeding 55% vol
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 200 per litre
	“

	
	2208.9032
	--- Imported in bulk for bottling, of an alcoholic strength by volume exceeding 55% vol but not exceeding 70% vol
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 300 per litre
	“

	
	2208.9033
	--- Imported in bulk for bottling, of an alcoholic strength by volume exceeding 70% vol
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 400 per litre
	“

	
	2208.9039
	--- Other
	L
	Value at importation
	Rs 300 per litre
	“


