
Dental Council (Registration of Dental Surgeons and Dental Specialists) (Amendment) 

Regulations 2022 

GN No. 318 of 2022 

Government Gazette of Mauritius No. 153 of 15 December 2022 

THE DENTAL COUNCIL ACT 

Regulations made by the Dental Council of Mauritius, with the approval of the Minister, under 

section 40 of the Dental Council Act 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Dental Council (Registration of Dental Surgeons and Dental 

Specialists) (Amendment) Regulations 2022. 

2. In these regulations – 

"principal regulations" means the Dental Council (Registration of Dental Surgeons and Dental 

Specialists) Regulations 2000. 

3. The principal regulations are amended by inserting, after regulation 413, the following new 

regulation – 

4C. (1) The Registrar may, where the Council is satisfied of the good character of the registered 

dental practitioner, issue a certificate of good standing to the registered dental practitioner. 

(2) The certificate of good standing shall be issued on payment of a fee of 2,000 rupees. 

4. Regulation of the principal regulations is amended - 

(a) in paragraph (1) – 

(i) in subparagraph (a), by deleting the words "2,500 rupees" and replacing them by the 

words "5,000 rupees"; 

(ii) in subparagraph (b), by deleting the words "5,000 rupees" and replacing them by the 

words "10,000 rupees"; 

(iii) in subparagraph (c), by deleting the words "5,000 rupees" and replacing them by the 

words "25,000 rupees"; 

(iv) in subparagraph (d), by deleting the words "10,000 rupees" and replacing them by the 

words "50,000 rupees"; 

(b) in paragraph (3) – 

(i) in subparagraph (a), by deleting the words "2,500 rupees" and "5,000 rupees" and 

replacing them by the words "5,000 rupees" and "10,000 rupees", respectively; 

(ii) in subparagraph (b), by deleting the words "5,000 rupees" and "10,000 rupees" and 

replacing them by the words "25,000 rupees" and "50,000 rupees", respectively; 



(iii) in subparagraph (c), by deleting the words "3,750 rupees" and "7,500 rupees" 

and replacing them by the words "7,500 rupees" and "15,000 rupees",  

respectively; 

(iv) in subparagraph (d), by deleting the words  "7,500 rupees" and "15,000 rupees" 

and replacing them by the words "37,500 rupees" and "75,000 rupees", respectively; 

5. These regulations shall be deemed to have come into operation on 1 December 2022. 

Made by the Dental Council of Mauritius, with the approval of the Minister, on 12 December 2022. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  


