Pensions (Amendment No. 2) Regulations 2022

GN No. 27 of 2022

Government Gazette of Mauritius No. 13 of 29 January 2022

THE PENSIONS ACT

Regulations made by the President under section 3

of the Pensions Act
1. These regulations may be cited as the Pensions (Amendment No. 2) Regulations 2022.

2. Inthese regulations —

"principal regulations" means the Pensions Regulations 1951.

3. Regulation 19 of the principal regulations is amended —

(a) in paragraphs (1)(b) and (2), by deleting the words "6,350 rupees" and replacing
them by the words "6,660" rupees;

(b) in paragraph (3)(a), by deleting the words "101,000 rupees" and replacing them by
the words "110,125 rupees";

(c) in paragraph (9)(b), by inserting, after the words "section 8(1)(c)", the words "or

(3)(b)()";
(d) in paragraph (10) —

(i) insubparagraph (a), by deleting the words "39,575 rupees" and replacing them
by the words "44,800 rupees";

(if) by deleting the words ", subject to paragraph (11),";
(e) by revoking paragraph (11);

4. These regulations shall be deemed to have come into operation on 1 January 2021.

Made by the President on 25 January 2022.



